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Date NH Brown Law 
Description 

Hours Rate Total 

8/3/18 mab Telephone calls to Stephen St. Cyr 
and Don Vaughan regarding 
litigation in Rosebrook rate case. 

0.2 N/C $0.00 

8/6/18 mab Drafted engagement letter for client's 
review.  Forwarded to client.  
Reviewed rate case procedural 
schedule and placed in calendar. 

0.4 N/C $0.00 

8/6/18 mab Reviewed Omni Hotel's motion to 
compel discovery.  Telephone call 
with Stephen St. Cyr and client.  
Reviewed prior discovery responses 
to Omni Hotel.  Drafted objection to 
motion, reviewed motion with client, 
arranged for mailing/filing.  
Reviewed pleadings (including Omni 
Hotel's motion to deem filing 
incomplete) and orders previously 
filed/issued in rate case.  Drafted 
supplemental data response. 

3.4 $175.00 $595.00 

8/8/18 mab Telephone call with Stephen St. Cyr 
regarding timing of Abenaki's set 3 
responses to Staff. 

0.1 N/C $0.00 

8/9/18 mab Reviewed final version of data 
responses, revised and discussed 
revisions with client.  Reviewed 
responses for completeness and 
prepared for distribution to parties. 

1 $175.00 $175.00 

8/13/18 mab Reviewed Omni Hotel motion for 
rehearing.  Discussed issues with 
client. 

0.5 $175.00 $87.50 

8/14/18 mab Researched caselaw on point.  
Drafted objection to Omni motion for 
rehearing.  Corresponded with client 
regarding rate case issues and 
testimony.  Finalized objection, 
verified citations, and arranged for 
filing. 

3.5 $175.00 $612.50 

8/20/18 mab Prepared for technical session and 
hearing.  Telephone call with Staff to 
discuss issues planned for upcoming 
tech session and hearing.  Telephone 
call with Don Vaughan to same. 

0.5 $175.00 $87.50 
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8/21/18 mab Prepared for technical session.  
Reviewed discovery and filings.  
Drafted agenda/notes for preparatory 
conference call.  Assembled caselaw 
supporting agreed-to temporary rate 
effective date. 

2 $175.00 $350.00 

8/22/18 mab Conference call with client group to 
discuss issues for technical session 
and hearing.  Reviewed and 
discussed Staff's proposed revenue 
requirement. 

1.3 $175.00 $227.50 

8/23/18 mab Attended technical session to discuss 
Staff's proposed adjustments to test 
year.  Discussed intervenor and OCA 
issues of concern as well as 
resolution of the concerns.  Drafted 
technical session data requests and 
forwarded to client.  Attended and 
presented settlement on temporary 
rates at hearing. 

5 $175.00 $875.00 

8/24/18 mab Revised data requests.  Corresponded 
with and telephone calls with client.  
Forwarded draft requests to parties 
for review. 

0.4 $175.00 $70.00 

8/28/18 mab Reviewed and corresponded with 
client regarding capital improvement 
plan and tech session responses. 

1 $175.00 $175.00 

8/31/18 mab Reviewed draft data responses and 
responded to client. 

0.1 N/C $0.00 

Customer Discount -245.00

Total: $3,010.00 
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Date NH Brown Law 
Description 

Hours Rate Total 

10/8/18 mab Reviewed correspondence from 
Staff regarding proposed schedule 
and review of outstanding issues.  
Advised client on preparation for 
tech session. 

0.3 N/C $0.00 

10/10/18 mab Corresponded with client 
regarding upcoming tech session 
and settlement discussions with 
intervenors.  Reviewed Staff data 
responses for completeness. 

1.2 $175.00 $210.00 

10/11/18 mab Corresponded with client 
regarding issues to raise at 
technical-settlement session. 

0.3 N/C $0.00 

10/12/18 mab Attended settlement conference in 
Concord. 

5 $175.00 $875.00 

10/18/18 mab Corresponded with client and 
advised client regarding 
settlement positions. 

0.2 $175.00 $35.00 

10/23/18 mab Telephone calls with client, Staff, 
and client to discuss settlement 
issues. 

1.1 $175.00 $192.50 

10/24/18 mab Discussed settlement options with 
client. 

0.2 N/C $0.00 

10/30/18 mab Telephone call with client group 
to discuss settlement and rate 
calculations.  Telephone call to 
Staff to discuss last two 
settlement issues.  Telephone call 
with OCA to discuss unintended 
rate impact to 1-inch residential 
customers.  Reviewed multiple 
rate calculations with client to 
alleviate unintended rate impact.  
Reviewed Staff's change of prior 
settled terms and advised client. 

2.7 $175.00 $472.50 
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10/31/18 mab Corresponded with Staff 
regarding settlement issues.  
Reviewed Omni settlement 
position and advised client.  
Prepared for conference call with 
client, attended conference call to 
discuss settlement issues and 
client calculations.  Drafted 
settlement response to parties and 
forwarded to client group for 
review.  Researched cost of cost 
of service experts. 

1.6 $175.00 $280.00 

 
$2,065.00 
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Date NH Brown Law 
Description 

Hours Rate Total 

9/4/18 mab Reviewed draft data responses from 
client and corresponded with client 
regarding revisions.  Prepared 
temporary rate compliance tariff.  
Corresponded with client further. 

2 $175.00 $350.00 

9/5/18 mab Telephone call with client to 
discuss data responses.  Drafted 
cover letter and filed temporary rate 
compliance tariffs. 

0.3 $175.00 $52.50 

9/5/18 mab Reviewed revised draft data 
responses and attachments from 
client for completeness.  
Corresponded with client. 

1.5 $175.00 $262.50 

9/6/18 mab Attended premeeting with client to 
prepare for technical session.  
Attended technical session with 
Staff and parties. 

4 $175.00 $700.00 

9/7/18 mab Drafted supplemental tech session 
data requests, circulated among 
parties for concurrence.  Revised 
requests per party comments.  
Forwarded requests to client. 

0.5 $175.00 $87.50 

9/11/18 mab Conducted legal research on 
settlement issues. 

1.7 N/C $0.00 

9/12/18 mab Reviewed draft responses for 
accuracy and completeness.  
Revised same and forwarded to 
client. 

1.5 $175.00 $262.50 

9/13/18 mab Reviewed draft discovery and 
corresponded with client regarding 
revisions, redactions, and 
confidential versions. Telephone 
call with former counsel.  
Confirmed NHPUC caselaw 
protecting confidential information. 

1.8 $175.00 $315.00 

9/14/18 mab Reviewed data responses for 
accuracy and completeness, 
forward to Staff and parties. 

0.6 $175.00 $105.00 

9/17/18 mab Telephone calls with accountant to 
discuss settlement issues.  
Corresponded with client to obtain 
final documents for Tech 1-8. 

0.6 $175.00 $105.00 
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9/18/18 mab Corresponded with client regarding 
discovery responses.  Telephone 
calls with client. Telephone call 
with OCA regarding meeting on 
rate design.  Telephone call with 
Staff regarding Staff's request to 
delay Staff testimony. 

0.7 $175.00 $122.50 

9/19/18 mab Telephone call with client 
regarding Tech 1-8 and savings 
documentation.  Reviewed Tech 1-
8 for completeness. 

0.7 $175.00 $122.50 

9/19/18 mab Telephone call with client to 
discuss timing of response to Staff 
settlement proposal and solicitation 
of OCA position on settlement 
issues. 

0.3 N/C $0.00 

9/20/18 mab Telephone call with accountant 
regarding summary sheet for Tech 
1-8.  Forwarded response to Tech
1-8 to Staff and parties.  Telephone
call to OCA to gain position on rate
design.  Corresponded with Staff.

0.2 N/C $0.00 

9/21/18 mab Reviewed supplemental response to 
Staff's supplemental request for 
Tech 1-8.  Revised.  Forwarded 
supplemental discovery to Staff and 
parties. 

0.2 $175.00 $35.00 

9/22/18 mab Reviewed and revised settlement 
response and data responses.  
Multiple telephone calls with 
Stephen St Cyr to discuss 
settlement and data responses. 

0.7 $175.00 $122.50 

9/24/18 mab Telephone call with accountant and 
OCA to set up conference call to 
discuss settlement. 

0.1 N/C $0.00 

9/25/18 mab Telephone call with counsel for 
Omni.  Telephone call with 
accountant to discuss settlement 
terms.  [Telephone call to OCA, 
corresponded with OCA to set up 
conference call to discuss 
settlement.  (N/C)]  Reviewed and 
revised ROE data requests.  
Corresponded with client regarding 
data requests. 

0.9 $175.00 $157.50  

9/26/18 mab Corresponded with OCA to set up 
conference call on settlement. 

0.1 N/C $0.00 
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Page 8 of 12 

9/28/18 mab Corresponded with OCA to set up 
conference call on settlement. 

0.1 N/C $0.00 

Total: $2,800.00 

Expenses 

9/10/18 Postage for tariff filing $24.70 $24.70 

9/13/18 Transcript fee for Commission's 
second hearing on temporary rates. 

$261.50 $261.50 

Subtotal: $286.20 

Total: $3,086.20 
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Date NH Brown Law 
Description 

Hrs Rate Total 

11/1/18 mab Reviewed additional changes to 
Abenaki's settlement response, 
forwarded to Staff and parties. 

0.3 N/C $0.00 

11/1/18 mab Reviewed Staff's draft settlement 
agreement.  Corrected internal 
references.  Proposed eliminating 
duplication by moving discovery on 
engineering proposal to financing 
docket.  Corresponded with client.  
Forwarded revisions to Settling Parties. 

2 $175.00 $124.00 

11/2/18 mab Multiple telephone calls with client 
group to discuss proposed settlement 
terms and Company's response.  
Corresponded with Staff and OCA to 
reach resolution.  Telephone call with 
counsel for Omni to discuss Omni's 
concerns. 

2 $175.00 $126.00 

11/3/18 mab Corresponded with client multiple times 
regarding settlement terms. 

0.5 $175.00 $87.50 

11/5/18 mab Prepared for hearing. 1.2 $175.00 $210.00 

11/6/18 mab Prepared for hearing.  Telephone calls 
with client group.  

2.5 $175.00 $437.50 

11/7/18 mab Met with witnesses prior to hearing.  
Represented client at hearing on the 
merits at NHPUC.  Facilitated additional 
settlement among the parties. 

4.3 $200.00 $860.00 

11/7/18 mab Revised settlement document post-
hearing to reflect additional settlement 
terms and corrections made at hearing.  
Corresponded with parties.  Circulated 
revised settlement pages for concurrence 
by Staff and the settling parties. 

1 $175.00 $175.00 

11/8/18 mab Corresponded with Staff and parties 
regarding filing of Exhibit 11. 

0.4 N/C $0.00 

11/20/18 mab Telephone call with accountant 
regarding procedural schedule.  
Corresponded with client regarding 
documents subject to discovery and the 
scope of discovery. 

0.5 $175.00 $87.50 
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11/21/18 mab Telephone call with accountant to 
discuss progress on procedural schedule 
for engineering study phase of rate case. 

0.1 N/C $0.00 

11/28/18 mab Reviewed intervenor's objection to 
settlement agreement.  Telephone call 
with Staff regarding record held open for 
Exhibit 11 and audit only.  Reviewed 
hearing transcript and statutes.  Drafted 
response for filing with Commission.  
Corresponded with client. 

1 $175.00 $175.00 

11/29/18 mab Reviewed client comments and revised 
response further.  Circulated draft to 
client group. 

0.8 $175.00 $140.00 

12/6/18 mab Reviewed Staff Recommendation and 
Final Audit Report.  Discussed with 
client lack of response from Audit to 
client inquiry on draft.  Inquired of Audit 
response with Staff Attorney. 

0.7 $175.00 $122.50 

12/7/18 mab Corresponded with Staff Attorney 
regarding inconsistency on Audit 
response. 

0.4 $175.00 $70.00 

12/27/18 mab Reviewed order, settlement, and staff 
recommendation in audit.  Summarized 
and advised client of action items and 
deadlines.  Prepared compliance tariffs.  
Corresponded with client regarding 
scope of tariff changes.  Determined 
NHPUC has not updated company tariff 
on web site. 

2.3 $175.00 $402.50 

12/28/18 mab Telephone call with client.  Researched 
Puc 1600 rules on recent observed 
changes in format of other utility 
compliance tariffs.  Confirmed accuracy 
of Rosebrook compliance tariffs.  
Arranged for filing.  Telephone call to 
NHPUC Staff regarding online version 
of tariff (N/C). 

0.8 $175.00 $140.00 

Subtotal: $3,157.50 
Expenses: 
11/29/18 Postage for Response to Intervenors $8.04 
12/10/18 Print Charge $4.45  

Subtotal: $12.49 
Total: $3,169.99 
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NH Brown Law, PLLC-AWC-Rosebrook Water Company 
January Invoice 

Date NH Brown Law  -  Rosebrook 
Rate Case 

Hours Rate Total 

1/4/19 mab Corresponded with client 
regarding timing of receipt of 
documents for review. 

0.1 N/C $0.00 

1/5/19 mab Reviewed for completeness and 
revised summary of capital 
improvement solutions 
Company evaluated.  
Corresponded with client group 
regarding revisions.  

1.5 $175.00 $262.50 

1/6/19 mab Followed up with Steve St. Cyr 
regarding filing. 

0.1 N/C $0.00 

1/15/19 mab Drafted motion for protective 
order and confidential treatment 
for hourly billing rate 
information.  Forwarded draft to 
accountant. 

2.3 $175.00 $402.50 

1/21/19 mab Telephone call with client to 
discuss documentation of rate 
case expenses.  Prepared for 
technical session. 

1 $175.00 $175.00 

Subtotal: $840.00 
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Stephen P. St. Cyr & Associates 
17 Sky Oaks Drive 
Biddeford, Me. 04005 
207-423-0215
stephenpstcyr@yahoo.com

January 21, 2019 

Pauline Doucette 
New England Service Company 
37 Northwest Drive 
Plainville, CT 06062 

Fee for professional services rendered during January / February 2019 (see attached 
detail). 

Current Billing (3.625 hours @ $135.00/hour) $   489.38 

Reimbursable Expenses: Copy   0.00 
Postage   0.00 
Mileage (… x $0.545)     0.00 

Total Current Month’s Billing $   489.38 

Payment due upon presentation.   

If you have any questions or comments, please call me at 207-423-0215. 

Sincerely, 

Stephen P. St. Cyr 
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Stephen P. St. Cyr & Associates 
17 Sky Oaks Drive 
Biddeford, Me. 04005 
207-423-0215
stephenpstcyr@yahoo.com

Date Description of Service Hours 
Year End / Other 
Total  0.00 
Note: Please charge to Outside Services (PUC account 923). 

Rosebrook Rate Case (DW 17-165) 
01/09 Review / Reply to email re: temp/perm diff & RC exp 0.25 
01/25 (est) Review temp/perm diff, RC exp & surcharge 0.75 
01/31 (est) Review temp/perm diff, RC exp & surcharge filing with PUC 0.50 
02/07 (est) Review Staff DRs 0.50 
02/14 (est) Review Co resp to Staff Drs 0.50 
02/21 (est) Review Staff’s recommendation  0.50 
02/28 (est) Review PUC order 0.25 
Total 3.25 

Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186) 
Rosebrook Rate Case. 

Return on Equity 
01/14 Prepare email re: PUC consultant costs 0.125 
01/15 Review PUC reply / Prepare email re: same 0.125 
01/17 Review var eamils re: PUC consultant costs 0.125 
Total 0.375 
Note: Please charge to Miscellaneous Deferred Debits (PUC account 186) 

Rosebrook ROE

Grand Total 3.625 

SPSt. Cyr 
01/21/19 
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Date NH Brown Law 
Description 

Hours Rate Total 

4/16/18 mab Telephone call with Don Vaughn to 
discuss scope of representation.  
Drafted engagement letter and 
forwarded to client.  Reviewed Motion 
to Dismiss and other filings in Docket 
No. DW 18-026. 

0.8 N/C $0.00 

4/18/18 mab Reviewed pleadings and testimony and 
for consistency with Puc rules and 
statutes.  Telephone call with client 
regarding recommended path forward. 

2 $175.00 $350.00 

4/19/18 mab Commenced drafting objection. 1 $175.00 $175.00 

4/22/18 mab Revised objection, corresponded with 
co-petitioners. 

3 $175.00 $525.00 

4/23/18 mab Telephone call with client team 
regarding content of objection.  
Revised objection further, drafted 
cover letter, and prepared document 
for filing. 

1.8 $175.00 $315.00 

4/29/18 mab Corresponded with client regarding 
procedural schedule and rate case.  
Reviewed expert Ahern's response to 
questions. 

0.2 $175.00 $35.00 

Total: $1,400.00 
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Date NH Brown Law 
Description 

Hours Rate Total 

5/1/18 mab Corresponded with intervenors 
regarding positions and procedural 
schedule. 

0.3 $175.00 $52.50 

5/15/18 mab Reviewed proposed settlement 
correspondence from OCA and 
LRWC.  Telephone call with client.  
Drafted email summarizing potential 
settlement responses and actions. 

0.5 $175.00 $87.50 

5/24/18 mab Reviewed proposed stipulation from 
parties.  Telephone call with client.  
Drafted correspondence to client 
explaining revisions to stipulation and 
procedural strategy. 

0.4 $175.00 $70.00 

5/25/18 mab Corresponded with client regarding 
position. 

0.1 N/C $0.00 

5/29/18 mab Drafted documents for filing testimony 
in rate case.  Revised stipulation and 
included proposed procedural 
schedule.  Flagged issues warranting 
follow-up and further discussion 
among client and parties.  
Corresponded with client regarding 
revisions to stipulation and procedural 
schedule. 

3 $175.00 $525.00 

5/30/18 mab Telephone call with client regarding 
additional revisions to documents.  
Arranged for filing. Reviewed 
correspondence from parties regarding 
Staff position and direction of ROE 
docket. 

0.4 N/C $0.00 

Subtotal: $735.00 
5/30/18 Printing charge, Ahern testimony and 

attachments. 
$155.48 $155.48 

Total: $890.48 
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Date NH Brown Law 
Description 

Hours Rate Total 

6/6/18 mab Reviewed Staff response to settlement.  
Offered alternative dates to address 
Staff's concerns but still move docket 
forward.  Circulated suggestions 
among utility parties.  Left message for 
Attorney Speidel regarding tech 
session date. 

0.3 $175.00 $52.50 

6/8/18 mab Telephone call with counsel regarding 
strategy for resolving docket matters. 

0.3 $175.00 $52.50 

6/8/18 mab Telephone call with Staff counsel 
regarding party's breach of 
confidentiality and best forum for 
resolution of ROE issues. 

0.3 $175.00 $52.50 

6/8/18 mab Telephone call to counsel regarding 
settlement talks. 

0.1 N/C $0.00 

6/18/18 mab Reviewed final version of settlement, 
client correspondence, sign document 
and forward to client. 

0.2 N/C $0.00 

Total: $157.50 
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